
// Magav // 

Catching a groove seems an 
effortless nature for French 
audiophile and vinyl addict, 
Magav. 

Presenting an infectious 
energy within his groovy 
percussion driven, melodically 
captivating deep, minimal 
house / tech sounds, that 
perpetually move a crowd as if 
it were magnetism with a wild 
force! Trust us, we’ve 
witnessed it!

No stranger to the scene 
across Europe and Australia 
after 8 years of consistent 
nurture and soul searching 
across various avenues of 
house music, not only behind 
the decks but equally behind 
the music, with an incredibly 
exciting debut vinyl EP to 
come in the next 18 months 
on Suena Hermosa, 
collaborating  with 
highly decorated 
remixers.



This contagiously energetic 
and fiercely talented 
young creator has already 
graced the decks at world 
renowned S.A.S.H in 
Australia, amongst many 
more, and has been working 
closely with legendary 
Lowris and Adema on their 
highly regarded ‘Full 
Scale’ project.

The past decade has seen 
this infectiously energetic 
and passionate artist play 
some of the hottest events 
across the world, serving 
endless unforgettable 
moments with his 
unmistakably unique, and 
elaborate storytelling 
through his every sonic 
journey. 

Magav’s fearless 
individualism and raw 
uniqueness in his 
productions, cultivate a 
tasty modern blend of eerie 
experimental elements with 
hypnotising minimal grooves, 
bringing a truly refreshing 
and intriguing new sound  to 
the table.  His DJ sets 
display a wholesome tribute 
to his vast inspirations 
across genres, and 
demonstrate his impressive 
depth as a truly 
distinguished digger. 



// Links // 

Soundcloud

Instagram

For Bookings 
Contact

Mariana @ 
Suena Agency 

Full Scale on Soundcloud

Facebook

https://on.soundcloud.com/BkeHc
https://www.instagram.com/magav_fr/?igshid=YmMyMTA2M2Y%3D
mailto:mariana@suenaagency.com
mailto:mariana@suenaagency.com
mailto:mariana@suenaagency.com
https://soundcloud.com/fullscalebxl
https://www.facebook.com/MagavSound/

